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In the male-dominated world of action cinema, women have often been
relegated to the sidelines. But throughout history, there have been a
number of women who have defied stereotypes and broken down barriers
to become some of the most successful and beloved actors in Hollywood.
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In Killer Tomatoes! Fifteen Tough Film Dames, author John Woo explores
the lives and careers of fifteen of these iconic female action stars. From
Sigourney Weaver to Michelle Rodriguez, these women have proven that
they can be just as tough, just as strong, and just as badass as their male
counterparts.

Woo's book is a celebration of these women and their contributions to the
action genre. He provides in-depth profiles of each actress, discussing her
early life, her rise to fame, and her most memorable roles. He also
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analyzes the impact that these women have had on the film industry and on
popular culture as a whole.

Killer Tomatoes! Fifteen Tough Film Dames is a must-read for any fan of
action movies or of strong female characters. Woo's writing is engaging
and informative, and his passion for the subject matter is evident on every
page.

The Fifteen Tough Film Dames

1. Sigourney Weaver

2. Michelle Rodriguez

3. Linda Hamilton

4. Pam Grier

5. Cynthia Rothrock

6. Zoe Bell

7. Lucy Liu

8. Angelina Jolie

9. Milla Jovovich

10. Kate Beckinsale

11. Charlize Theron

12. Scarlett Johansson

13. Emily Blunt

14. Jennifer Lawrence



15. Gal Gadot

About the Author

John Woo is a Hong Kong-born American film director, producer, and
screenwriter. He is best known for his action films, which have grossed
over $1 billion worldwide. Woo's films often feature strong female
characters, and he has been praised for his ability to create complex and
sympathetic female heroes.

Woo's other works include A Better Tomorrow, The Killer, Hard Boiled,
Face/Off, and Mission: Impossible 2.
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Killer Tomatoes! Fifteen Tough Film Dames is available now from Our Book
Library, Barnes & Noble, and other major booksellers.
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